Bid Abstract IFB No. 12-05
Custodial Supplies, Annual Requirements
Paper Products & Dispensers
Maintenance & Operations (M&O Dept.)

Item Items, Descriptions, P& R. Paper Supply Co. J. C. Nelson California Janitorial Cleansournce All Star Sales
Est. Qty (Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Price Unit
No. & Suggested Brands Unit = Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price  |Amount Unit Amount Unit  [Price Amount
n Paper Liner for feminine hygiene disposal receptacle 500 CS (500 CS |[same $19.43 $58.29|same $19.72 $59.16/same $17.99 $53.97|same $15.65 $46.95 No Bid |No Bid
White Towel, approximately 700 feet per roll, EPA compliant / 47 24.976.44 6 31 4 91 959,08 6 38.0 26.524.0 38,60 26.942.8 6 92 95 16.019.1
2 recycled 6 RO/CS (698 CS |same $34.78 $24,276. RO/CS $31.46 $21,959.0 RO/CS $38.00| $26,524.00|same $38. $26,942.80 RO/CS $22.9 $16,019.10
Bathroon Tissue, white 2-ply, sheet size: 3.85" x 4.05", 1000 sheets|18 36 36 12 36
3 |per roll, EPA Compliant recycled RO/CS 375 CS RO/CS $32.94 $12,352.50 RO/CS $32.36 $12,135.00|same $36.99| $13,871.25 RO/CS $28.10[ $10,537.50 RO/CS $32.45 $12,168.75
Toilet Tissue, white 2-ply, 100 sheets per roll, sheet size: 3.85" x |36 36 36 36 36
186 CS |RO/CS $32.94 $6,126.84|RO/CS $32.36 $6,018.96|RO/CS $36.99 $6,880.14|same $39.95 $7,430.70| RO/CS | $32.45 $6,035.70
4 |4.05" RO/CS 1000 865 1000 1000
20
5 Seat Covers, 250 per pack 5000/cs B 95CS |[same $21.89 $2,079.55|same $40.45 $3,842.75|same $23.99 $2,279.05|same $24.70 $2,346.50|same $34.90 $3,315.50
Paper Towel, Multifold, white, 250 sheets per pack, sheet size: 16 20/CS
75CS |[same $16.98 $1,273.50 $18.93 $1,419.75|same $17.99 $1,349.25|same $17.20 $1,290.00|same $18.50 $1,387.50
6 ]9.25" x 9.50" PK/CS 200/PK
Toilet Tissue Dispenser, covered, side-by-side, 2 roll dispenser, mini
high capacity, with maximum sheets per roll not to exceed "1500".
Color: Smoke or dark color,” MUST ACCEPT PROPOSED 24EA [24EA |same $9.10 $218.40{same N/C N/C same $12.99 $311.76 $3.50 $84.00|same $16.00 $384.00
7 |ROLL". jumbo
Toilet paper Dispenser, two roll dispenser, covered, vertical mount,
Color: Translucent Smoke or dark color "MUST ACCEPT 24EA [24EA [same $9.10 $218.40{same N/C N/C same $12.99 $311.76[same $3.00 $72.00{same $16.00 $384.00
8 |PROPOSED ROLL".
Seat Cover Dispenser, Color: Smoke or dark color, plastic, holds 1o e n 50 A |same $6.59 $329.50[same $10.68 $534.00[same $9.77 $488.50[same $3.00 $150.00[same $6.00 $300.00
9 |two packages of seat covers, Size: 16"X x 12"H x 3"D
Single Towel Dispenser, high capacity, holds estimated 700" of
towel, MUST ACCEPT PROPOSED ROLL. Hands Free:
comparable to: Georgia Pacific "'Soft pull”’, Wausau 5EA 5EA |[same $9.10 $45.50{same N/C N/C same $5.00 $25.00|same $3.50 $17.50|same $26.00 $130.00
10 |"Opatiserv", Tork "Torkmatic", or "Intuition™. Must not be
Taxable Sub-total $46,978.92 $45,968.70 $52,094.68 $48,917.95 $40,124.55
8.75% Tax (CA) 8.75% $4,110.66 $4,022.26 $4,558.25 $4,280.32 $3,510.90
Total Amount $51,089.58 $49,990.96 $56,652.96 $53,198.27 $43,635.45
Addendum #1 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Non-Collusion Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes




Maintenance & Operations (M&O Dept.)

Page #2
Item Items, Descriptions, Tri-State Surgical Supply Sac Val Cole Supply Waxie Unisource
. Unit Unit Unit R Unit
No. & Suggested Brands Unit Est. Qty |Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price  |Amount Unit Unit Price Amount Unit  |Price Amount
1 |Paper Liner for feminine hygiene disposal receptacle 500 CS [500 CS No Bid |No Bid same $21.71 $65.13|same $12.57 $37.71[same $15.40 $46.20 same $15.00 $45.00
White Towel, approximately 700 feet per roll, EPA compliant 6 6 8
6 RO/CS (698 CS |RO/CS $36.67 $25,595.66|same $41.19 $28,750.62|same $37.00] $25,826.00|RO/CS $35.87| $25,037.26| RO/CS| $39.77 $15,311.45
2 |recycled 740' 950' 950'
Bathroon Tissue, white 2-ply, sheet size: 3.85" x 4.05", 1000 sheets|18 18 36 18 12
375CS No Bid |No Bid RO/CS $30.30 $11,362.50|RO/CS | $35.98| $13,492.50(RO/CS $27.17( $10,188.75| RO/CS| $35.96 $13,485.00
3 |per roll, EPA Compliant recycled RO/CS 1500 1000 1500 1150'
Toilet Tissue, white 2-ply, 100 sheets per roll, sheet size: 3.85" x |36 36 18 36 36
186 CS No Bid |No Bid RO/CS $40.00 $7,440.00|RO/CS $27.25 $5,068.50|RO/CS $35.87 $6,671.82| RO/CS| $39.18 $7,287.48
4 14.05" RO/CS 1000 1500 1000 1000
5 Seat Covers, 250 per pack 5000/cs |23?<ICS 95CS |[same $20.75 $1,971.25|same $22.65 $2,151.75|same $19.38 $1,841.10|same $23.38 $2,221.10|same $24.75 $2,351.25
Paper Towel, Multifold, white, 250 sheets per pack, sheet size: |16 scs |23 | s16.18 $1,213.50[same $16.35|  $1,226.25(same | $15.48|  $1,161.00|same $16.00|  $1,200.00[same | $19.88 $1,491.00
6 ]9.25" x 9.50 PK/CS CS
Toilet Tissue Dispenser, covered, side-by-side, 2 roll dispenser,
high capacity, with maximum sheets per roll not to exceed "1500". . .
Color: Smoke or dark color,” MUST ACCEPT PROPOSED 24EA |24 EA No Bid |No Bid same N/C N/C same $5.00 $120.00|same  |N/C N/C same |N/C N/C
7 |ROLL".
Toilet paper Dispenser, two roll dispenser, covered, vertical mount,
Color: Translucent Smoke or dark color *"MUST ACCEPT 24EA [24EA No Bid |No Bid same N/C N/C same $5.00 $120.00|same  |N/C N/C same [N/C N/C
8 [PROPOSED ROLL".
Seat Cover Dispenser, Color: Smoke or dark color, plastic, holds 15, 2+ 50 £ NoBid |No Bid same $7.15 $327.50|same $5.80 $290.00[same  |N/C N/C same $5.00 $250.00
9 |two packages of seat covers, Size: 16"X x 12"H x 3"D
Single Towel Dispenser, high capacity, holds estimated 700" of
towel, MUST ACCEPT PROPOSED ROLL. Hands Free:
comparable to: Georgia Pacific "'Soft pull™, Wausau 5EA 5EA No Bid |No Bid same N/C N/C same $25.50 $127.50|same  |N/C N/C same [N/C N/C
"'Opatiserv"', Tork "Torkmatic', or "Intuition". Must not be
10 |battery operated.
Taxable Sub-total $28,780.41 $51,441.39 $48,084.31 $45,365.13 $40,221.18
8.75% Tax (CA) 8.75% $2,518.29 $4,501.12 $4,207.38 $3,969.45 $3,519.35
Total Amount $31,298.70 $55,942.51 $52,291.69 $49,334.58 $43,740.53
Addendum #1 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Non-Collusion Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes




Maintenance & Operations (M&O Dept.)

Page #3
Item Items, Descriptions, Hillyard Starline Supply
. Unit Unit Unit o Unit
No. & Suggested Brands Unit Est. Qty |Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price  |Amount Unit Unit Price Amount Unit  |Price Amount
1 |Paper Liner for feminine hygiene disposal receptacle 500 CS [500 CS |same $15.97 $47.91|same $21.90 $65.70
White Towel, approximately 700 feet per roll, EPA compliant 6
6 RO/CS [698 CS |RO/CS $22.68 $13,857.48|800' $34.77 $24,264.46
2 |recycled 800'
Bathroon Tissue, white 2-ply, sheet size: 3.85" x 4.05", 1000 sheets|18 36
375 CS $36.05 $13,518.75|RO/CS $35.77 $13,413.75
3 |per roll, EPA Compliant recycled RO/CS 36 RO/CS 1 865
Toilet Tissue, white 2-ply, 100 sheets per roll, sheet size: 3.85" x |36 36 36
186 CS [RO/CS $36.05 $6,705.30|RO/CS $35.77 $6,653.22
4 14.05" RO/CS 1000 865
5 Seat Covers, 250 per pack 5000/cs é?(/CS 95CS |[same $27.48 $2,610.60|same $23.34 $2,217.30
5 gazp:r)'(rgv:él Multifold, white, 250 sheets per pack, sheet size: ;(:(/CS 75Cs  |same $16.30 $1,222.50|same $20.9 $1.560.00
Toilet Tissue Dispenser, covered, side-by-side, 2 roll dispenser,
high capacity, with maximum sheets per roll not to exceed "1500".
Color: Smoke or dark color,” MUST ACCEPT PROPOSED |2/ EA  [24EA  |same $5.00 $120.001same IN/C - |N/C
7 |ROLL".
Toilet paper Dispenser, two roll dispenser, covered, vertical mount,
Color: Translucent Smoke or dark color "MUST ACCEPT 24EA [24EA |[same $5.00 $120.00{same N/C N/C
8 |PROPOSED ROLL".
Seat Cover Dispenser, Color: Smoke or dark color, plastic, holds
9 |two packages of seat covers, Size: 16"X x 12°H x 3'D 50 EA [50 EA |same $11.34 $567.00[{same $13.25 $662.50
Single Towel Dispenser, high capacity, holds estimated 700" of
towel, MUST ACCEPT PROPOSED ROLL. Hands Free:
comparable to: Georgia Pacific "'Soft pull"*, Wausau 5EA 5 EA N/B N/B same N/C N/C
""Opatiserv", Tork "Torkmatic", or "'Intuition'". Must not be
10 [battery operated.
Taxable Sub-total $38,769.54 $48,850.93
8.75% Tax (CA) 8.75% $3,392.33 $4,274.46
Total Amount $42,161.87 $53,125.39
Addendum #1 Yes No
Non-Collusion Yes Yes
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